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Bid Name: Supply and Delivery - Bulk Pool Chemicals and Equipment

ProRFx ID: ITB03172500000040 Buyer: Eileen Marquez
Solicitation: ITB# REC/250514 Buyer Email: emarquez@ocalafl.org
Bids: 2 Buyer Phone: 352-629-8363

4/30/2025 Notice of Intent to Award to Aquasol Commercial Chemical, Inc. d/b/a Poolsure pending City Council
approval.

Bidder Name & Office Location Office Ll (e Sl s (el

Location Term)
: : 108,485.4
Aquasol Commercial Chemical, Inc. d/b/a | Houston, 3 08'P85‘, 0
Poolsure > Pool Chemical i Lease Maintenance
$91,655.40 $13,680.00 $3,150.00
$52,958.22
Commercial Energy Specialists Jupiter, FL | 50| chemical oment Lease Praventive
$35,396.70 $14,681.52 $2,880.00)
Aquasol Commercial Chemical, q AT
BIDDER Inc. d/b/a Poolsure Commercial Energy Specialists

INITIAL CONTRACT TERM PRICING: CHEMICALS

EST
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT COST ANNUAL COST UNIT COST ANNUAL COST

1 Gallon Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% mini bulk liquid 5,800 $3.25 $18,850.00 No bid No bid
2 Gallon Sulfuric Acid 38% mini bulk liquid 700 $3.95 $2,765.00 No bid No bid
3 50 Ib bag Sodium Bicarbonate 110 $33.00 $3,630.00 $39.88 $4,386.80
4 50 Ib bag Cyanuric Acid (Stabilizer) 25 $99.76 $2,494.00 $196.98 $4,924.50
5 50 Ib bag Calcium Chloride Flakes 60 $46.88 $2,812.80 $41.46 $2,487.60
ANNUAL AMOUNT $30,551.80 $11,798.90

TOTAL: INITIAL CONTRACT TERM PRICING $91,655.40 $35,396.70

INTIAL CONTRACT TERM PRICING: EQUIPMENT LEASE

MONTHLY TOTAL MONTHLY MONTHLY TOTAL MONTHLY
DESCRIPTION Qry LEASE LEASE AMOUNT LEASE LEASE AMOUNT
AMOUNT AMOUNT
6 EA Programmable pH aqd sanitizer ORP controller > $90.00 $180.00 $135.39 $270.78
with remote monitoring
7 EA Stenner pumps (rated for pool sizing) 8 $25.00 $200.00 $17.13 $137.04
- . PROVIDED AT PROVIDED AT NO . .
8 EA 325-gallon lliquid Chlorine tank 2 NO COST COST No Bid No Bid
. . PROVIDED AT PROVIDED AT NO . .
9 EA 165-gallon bulk sulfuric acid tank 2 NO COST COST No Bid No Bid
Lo . PROVIDED AT PROVIDED AT NO . .
10 EA 165-gallon liquid Chlorine tank 1 NO COST COST No Bid No Bid
. . PROVIDED AT PROVIDED AT NO . .
11 EA 100-gallon bulk sulfuric acid tank 1 NO COST COST No Bid No Bid
ANNUAL LEASE AMOUNT $4,560.00 $4,893.84
TOTAL: EQUIPMENT LEASING INITIAL TERM PRICING $13,680.00 $14,681.52




Aquasol Commercial Chemical,

Inc. d/b/a Poolsure Commercial Energy Specialists

BIDDER

INTIAL CONTRACT TERM PRICING: PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE

DESCRIPTION ANé\lTliAL UNIT COST ANNUAL COST UNIT COST ANNUAL COST
Preventive maintenance for chemical pumping
12 LS equipment at all three locations. (April & 2 $525.00 $1,050.00 $480.00 $960.00
October)
TOTAL: PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE INITIAL TERM PRICING $3,150.00 $2,880.00

HOURLY EQUIPMENT MAINTENANCE AND SERVICES*

TOTAL COST PER TOTAL COST PER

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST HOUR UNIT COST HOUR

13 HR Hourly rate for equipment maintenance and 1 $130.00 $130.00| $185.00 $185.00

servicing during normal hours

14 HR Hourly rate for Emergency/after-hours 1 $165.00 $165.00| $250.00 $250.00

equipment maintenance and servicing

TOTAL BID (Grand total of all line items excluding hourly rates ) $108,485.40 $52,958.22
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